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Intellect Discover launches on the Ingenta Edify Platform  
 
Ingenta is pleased to announce the launch of Intellect Discover on our Edify platform, 
intellectdiscover.com on 20 April 2023.  
 
This platform was launched as part of longstanding partnership with Intellect. As Intellect’s 
needs expanded, we were able to provide our Ingenta Edify platform to provide increased 
flexibility and functionality and to let them grow their content in the future.  The migration and 
implementation was both quick and painless due to the strong teams at both Ingenta and 
Intellect.  
 
Ingenta Edify is a full-service content delivery platform designed to connect your audience 
with the content they need. This content-agnostic platform delivers many types of content 
and can expand quickly and easily to display, market and monetize new content types. Edify 
is ideal for organizations that want to make a change of platforms using a quick project and a 
convenient customizable content-delivery solution with comprehensive features and 
functionality. 
 
‘Discover will bring our thriving journals and books programmes together on one platform. 
The launch is the first step on an exciting journey - we intend to make the most of the 
multimedia capacity of the platform which will in future be the home of innovative video and 
audio research and teaching content. We will also continue to improve the functionality 
based on the feedback of our readers. This is a significant development for Intellect, allowing 
us more direct communication with our customers, and another step in our ongoing 
commitment to bringing the best service to our authors.’ 
Mark Lewis, Intellect Managing Director 
 
“We are always pleased at being able to help unlock the future plans for our partners and 
this implementation is a testament to the strong partnership we have with Intellect.  Our 
mutual commitment to help get all of the materials into the hands of the people who need it 
helps drive our future platform development. We look forward to continuing to expand this 
partnership and to enable Intellect to take advantage of all of the offerings on our Edify 
suite.” 
Scott Winner, CEO Ingenta 
 
“We very much enjoyed working with Ingenta on implementation: the team was 
knowledgeable, enthusiastic and supportive, and we have been able to tailor the platform to 
the requirements of our business.” 
Jelena Stanovnik, Intellect Project Development Manager 
 



About ingenta 
 
Ingenta is a world-leading provider of content solutions that transform businesses. We 
provide business solutions to media markets through highly configurable software and 
services deployed into complex business environments with knowledgeable and engaged 
staff, and superior service and support. Listed on the AIM market of the London Stock 
Exchange, the company operates jointly from Europe (Oxford) and North America (New 
Jersey). 
 
To find out more about Ingenta Edify visit www.ingenta.com 
Contact Heather Lantz, mailto:heather.lantz@ingenta.com 
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